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1. Abstract
Body packing represents the concealment of illegal substances in 
a person's body with the aim of smuggling. Body packers either 
swallow drug-filled packets or introduce drug-filled packets into 
their bodies through rectum or vagina. In the world, the three main 
smuggled drugs are cocaine, heroin and cannabis products.  Com-
plications of body packing include acute narcotic toxicity from 
drug exposure, intestinal obstruction owing to pellet impaction 
and bowel perforation with consequent abdominal sepsis. I docu-
ment here two heroin body packers, who suffered serious toxicity 
from exposure.

2. Introduction
The transportation of illicit substances in body cavities, document-
ed in the last few decades, is considered an expanding and profit-
able commercial activity throughout the world. 

Body packing describes the intracorporeal concealment of illicit 
substance in the alimentary tract. "Body packers" are also known 
as "drug mules", "swallowers", "internal carriers" or "couriers". A 
wide range of illicit drugs may be transported in this way, includ-
ing cocaine, heroin, hashish and amphetamines.

First case of body packing, reported in 1973 was that of a patient 
with complete small bowel obstruction 13 days after swallowing a 
condom containing hashish [1].

Body packers are persons who illegally carry illicit substance. The 
packets can be made of various materials, but most often are con-
doms, which are easily available on the market. The packets are 
inserted in the mouth, rectum, or vagina to transport across borders 
without being detected. 

The most serious complications of this syndrome, known as body 
packing, are acute intoxication and ileus. 

I document here two cases of body packing recorded for the first 
time from Sri Lanka.

In spite of increased prevalence of body packing, there are still 
some controversies in the management of these patients. On the 
other hand, considering the difference between Iran and Western 
countries with respect to the type of smuggled substances (most-
ly opium and crack which is concentrated heroin compared with 
cocaine and occasionally amphetamines) few studies exist on the 
management of packers in Iran.

3. Case Reports
SD, a 37-year-old male an Austrian transit passenger at the Banda-
ranaike International Airport, Katunayaka, Sri Lanka, was referred 
by the airport medical officer to a private hospital in Colombo, and 
admitted at 2.25 a.m. by the staff of an airline. He had convulsions 
and cyanosis at the airport and was given diazepam 10 mg intra-
muscularly.

On admission to the Intensive Care Unit (ICU), he was conscious, 
confused and drowsy. His respiratory rate was 28/minute and the 
pulse rate was 112/minute. His blood pressure was 130/60 mm. 
Hg. His pupils were size 5 and reacted to light.  He was given 
diazepam 10 mg and 50 cc of 50% dextrose intravenously and ox-
ygen inhalation. His secretions were sucked out. His naso-gastric 
aspirate was coffee ground in colour. He was given ranitidine 50 
mg IV.

He developed two generalized convulsions in the ICU. He was 
given of intravenous naloxone 1 mg IV.
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Subsequently, 2 condoms packed with a white powder have been 
recovered from his rectum. One of them had burst inside the rec-
tum. 

He was transferred to the Medical Intensive Care Unit (MICU) of 
the General Hospital, Colombo at 12.30 p.m. the following day.

Arterial blood gas analysis performed soon after admission re-
vealed a respiratory acidosis with a pH value of 7.271, carbon di-
oxide tension (paCO2) 53.6 mmHg, oxygen tension (paO2) 60.3, 
oxygen saturation SaO2 86.3%.

He was treated with oxygen (inspired fraction FiO2 40%) admin-
istered via a face mask, cimetidine 200 mg 8 hourly, a continuous 
IV infusion of naloxone, supplemented by intravenous boluses de-
pending on the pupillary constriction. The vital signs were closely 
monitored including continuous electrocardiographic (ECG) mon-
itoring.

He was given 12 mg of naloxone as an IV infusion from 12.30 
p.m. to 4 a.m. the following day. In addition, when the pupil size 
became less that 2 mm, naloxone 0.4 mg was given on five occa-
sions.

His wife, 24-year-old REN who was travelling with him was also 
admitted with convulsions, drowsiness and cyanosis to the same 
hospital.

A condom packed with a white powder was extracted from her 
rectum. 

She was also given 5 mg of naloxone IV in multiple doses and 
transferred the following day to the MICU, General Hospital, Co-
lombo at 12.30 p.m. 

Both were discharged from the MICU after 60 hours. They were 
conscious and alert. There was no respiratory difficulty.

The white powder in condoms of both patients was analyzed and 
heroin was detected.

Both were indicted in the High Court, Colombo, for illegal import 
and possession of heroin. SD, who had 37 grammes of heroin was 
convicted and sentenced to 5 years rigorous imprisonment 5 years 
later.  REN who had 41 grammes of heroin was convicted and sen-
tenced to 13 years rigorous imprisonment 2 years later. 

4. Discussion 
Both patients developed serious toxic effects of heroin as a result 
of the damage to the condoms.  Prompt therapy with naloxone 
helped their recovery.

Imaging is essential in diagnosing body packing. Upright abdom-
inal radiography and abdominal computed tomography are useful 
to detect body packing. (Mayo)

Body packing has been reported from many countries. In a study 
assessing the epidemiological data and management methods of 
175 body packers in Iran, attempted methods of body packing 
were ingestion (97.7%), rectal enema (1.7%), and vaginal inser-

tion (0.6%). The mortality rate was (3%).   The most common 
concealed substances were crack (37%), crystal (the street name of 
methamphetamine in Iran) (17%), opium (13%), and heroin (6%), 
respectively. The type of packed substances was not specified in 
27% of cases [2].

Apart from antidote therapy, management for body packer syn-
drome may include whole bowel irrigation and percutaneous en-
doscopic gastrostomy.

Antidote therapy with naloxone was also used. Nineteen percent 
of patients underwent surgery. Indications for surgical interven-
tion were signs and symptoms of intoxication with stimulants or 
opioids that did not respond to antidote therapy. In this study, for-
ty-eight patients underwent surgery. Indications for surgical inter-
vention were signs and symptoms of intoxication with stimulants 
or opioids that did not respond to antidote therapy with naloxone 
(79%), gastro-intestinal obstruction (17%), gastro-intestinal bleed-
ing (2%), and peritonitis (2%). For these 48 patients, 24 (50%) 
underwent laparotomy and gastrotomy.

In a study of 50 body packer deaths in New York City from 1990 to 
2001, the majority (37/50) of deaths were caused by acute intoxi-
cations due to open or leaking drug packets in the gastrointestinal 
tract.

Intestinal obstruction and life-threatening sympathomimetic tox-
idrome including seizures, ventricular dysrhythmia, and cardiac 
arrest has occurred from the rupture of cocaine packages.

The first body packer case reported in Portugal in 2009 was fatal, 
as he has ingested 56 cocaine packets [3].

Early diagnosis is essential and correct treatment of body packing 
can be lifesaving.
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